SPECIFICATION: B-006 OF 2018/19

NUMBER OF ADDENDA ISSUED: 0

BID DATE: JULY 24, 2018

TITLE: GENERAL SERVICE CONTRACT - ASBESTOS ABATMENT AND ENVIRONMENTAL CLEAN-UP WORK

LOCATION: VARIOUS

CONTRACTOR BID AMOUNT REMARKS
DIAMOND HUNTBACK CONSTRUCTION CORP.
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT UNIT OF MEASURE

A. LABOR
1. Asbestos insulation worker

a_All-Inclusive Straight Time $110.00 Per Hour

b. All-Inclusive Premium Time $132.00 Per Hour
2. Asbestos Insulation Supervisor

a_All-Inclusive Straight Time $135.00 Per Hour

b. All-Inclusive Premium Time $165.00 Per Hour
3. Insulator Apprentice

a_All-Inclusive Straight Time No Bid Per Hour

b. All-Inclusive Premium Time No Bid Per Hour
4. Insulator Journeyman

a_All-Inclusive Straight Time No Bid Per Hour

b. All-Inclusive Premium Time No Bid Per Hour
5. Asbestos Worker Laborer

a_All-Inclusive Straight Time $105.00 Per Hour

b. All-Inclusive Premium Time $150.00 Per Hour
6. Asbestos Supervisor Laborer

a_All-Inclusive Straight Time $125.00 Per Hour

b. All-Inclusive Premium Time $150.00 Per Hour
B. DISPOSAL (Mark up on cost) 151%
C. MATERIALS (Mark up on material not listed in Sec 01 1000, Part 4, Scope of Work) 15%
D. DISCOUNT FOR EARLY PAYMENT 1%




SPECIFICATION: B-006 OF 2018/19

NUMBER OF ADDENDA ISSUED: 0

BID DATE: JULY 24, 2018

TITLE: GENERAL SERVICE CONTRACT - ASBESTOS ABATMENT AND ENVIRONMENTAL CLEAN-UP WORK

LOCATION: VARIOUS

CONTRACTOR BID AMOUNT REMARKS
PEPPER ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES INC.
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT UNIT OF MEASURE

A. LABOR
1. Asbestos insulation worker

a_All-Inclusive Straight Time No Bid Per Hour

b. All-Inclusive Premium Time No Bid Per Hour
2. Asbestos Insulation Supervisor

a_All-Inclusive Straight Time No Bid Per Hour

b. All-Inclusive Premium Time No Bid Per Hour
3. Insulator Apprentice

a_All-Inclusive Straight Time No Bid Per Hour

b. All-Inclusive Premium Time No Bid Per Hour
4. Insulator Journeyman

a_All-Inclusive Straight Time No Bid Per Hour

b. All-Inclusive Premium Time No Bid Per Hour
5. Asbestos Worker Laborer

a_All-Inclusive Straight Time $101.00 Per Hour

b. All-Inclusive Premium Time $104.00 Per Hour
6. Asbestos Supervisor Laborer

a_All-Inclusive Straight Time $132.00 Per Hour

b. All-Inclusive Premium Time $136.00 Per Hour
B. DISPOSAL (Mark up on cost) 151%
C. MATERIALS (Mark up on material not listed in Sec 01 1000, Part 4, Scope of Work) 15%
D. DISCOUNT FOR EARLY PAYMENT 2|%




SPECIFICATION: B-006 OF 2018/19

NUMBER OF ADDENDA ISSUED: 0

BID DATE: JULY 24, 2018

TITLE: GENERAL SERVICE CONTRACT - ASBESTOS ABATMENT AND ENVIRONMENTAL CLEAN-UP WORK

LOCATION: VARIOUS

CONTRACTOR BID AMOUNT REMARKS
PRIME GROUP REMEDIATION, INC.
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT UNIT OF MEASURE

A. LABOR
1. Asbestos insulation worker

a_All-Inclusive Straight Time $106.00 Per Hour

b. All-Inclusive Premium Time $126.00 Per Hour
2. Asbestos Insulation Supervisor

a_All-Inclusive Straight Time $120.00 Per Hour

b. All-Inclusive Premium Time $180.00 Per Hour
3. Insulator Apprentice

a_All-Inclusive Straight Time $111.00 Per Hour

b. All-Inclusive Premium Time $156.00 Per Hour
4. Insulator Journeyman

a_All-Inclusive Straight Time $120.00 Per Hour

b. All-Inclusive Premium Time $180.00 Per Hour
5. Asbestos Worker Laborer

a_All-Inclusive Straight Time $96.00 Per Hour

b. All-Inclusive Premium Time $110.00 Per Hour
6. Asbestos Supervisor Laborer

a_All-Inclusive Straight Time $110.00 Per Hour

b. All-Inclusive Premium Time $136.00 Per Hour
B. DISPOSAL (Mark up on cost) 101%
C. MATERIALS (Mark up on material not listed in Sec 01 1000, Part 4, Scope of Work) 10]1%
D. DISCOUNT FOR EARLY PAYMENT 1%




